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25.06.2024 

 
Matter taken up. 
 

   Shri Ashish Shroti, Learned Counsel for the Appellant. 
   Shri J.K. Pillai, Learned Counsel for the Respondent. 
 

Perused the report of the Registry. 
 
The impugned order is of 05.04.2024. The appeal has been filed 
on 30-05-2024, hence within limitation. The appeal is registered. 
 
Application by respondent with affidavit for dismissing the appeal 
due to non compliance of pre deposit under section 7(O) of the 
Act filed today. Respondent also filed reply of IA with affidavit. 
Copy served on appellant Ld Counsel. Taken on record. Heard 
application of respondent filed today for dismissal & IA filed by 
appellant together. Established facts are that EPF appeal number 
680(8)2012 was filed by appellant which was decided by 
Tribunal on 18.10.2016. The matter was remanded to respondent 
for fresh inquiry and order regarding refund of pre-deposit.  
 
In Writ Petition 18759/2016 filed by respondent against the 
order dated 18.10.2016 passed by Tribunal filed by respondent 
especially against direction of this Tribunal for refund of pre 
deposit is pending in which admittedly this direction of refund of 
pre-deposit was stayed by Honb’le High Court Vide order dated 
16.11.2016 which is still in force.  
 
The present appeal has been filed against order of respondent 
deciding the matter under the direction of the remand order.  
 
Since, there is already a pre-deposit in this matter which is with 
respondents on date. Prayer of appellant Ld Counsel dispensing 
the pre deposit is granted. Consequently, application of dismissal 
of appeal is dismissed. Regarding IA, the Respondents are 
directed not to take coercive method of recovery of amount of 
appeal till final disposal. 
 
The application for dismissal of appeal as well as IA stand 
disposed accordingly.  
 

     List the case for final arguments on                                                      

 

 

                                                                            Presiding Officer 

 
 

 



 

 

 
 



 

 

 
 

 

 


